TEM	РНОТО	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT SIZE AND IMPRINT AREA DIMENSIONS	COLOR	ENGLISH VERSION	SPANISH VERSION	TOTAL QUANITY	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1		Antibacterial Sanitizer Unscented BZK Wet Wipes	Product size: 6"W x 2-1/4"H		QUANTITY	QUNATITY		1.86	4650
	0/22	Active Ingradient: Benzalkonium Chloride Skin Safety: FDA approved	First Connections logo in full color on a white label.						
	Othey	Wipes per pack: 15 unscented wipes.	Imprint area: approx. 2-3/4"W x 1-1/2"H						
100					2000	500	2500		
2		Reusable Forehead Thermomater in Sleeve	Product size: 2-7/10"W x 1.23"H					1.37	4110
	W YSEN ME	Liquid crystal display. Heavy duty paper sleeve. Usage instructions printed inside sleeve	First Connections logo in full color on the sleeve.						
			Imprint area: 2"W x 1"H (on the sleeve)						
	Millenium								
1									
3		Touchless Anti-Germ Utility Key Tool with Retractable Badge Reel	Product size: 2-1/2"W x 3-3/8"H	White	2500	500	3000	No Bid	0
Ĩ	0	Lightweight tool, reinforced nylon hook, designed for							
	T	opening door handles of many sizes, up to 35 pounds. Rubberized tip (not a stylus) designed to use with various keypads. Includes carabiner and a 30"	First Connections logo in full color Imprint area: 13/16" Dia. (insert on badge reel)						
		retractable badge reel with metal pocket clip on back.							
	Σμ								
1	F			Badge Reel Color: Blue					
4		Touchless Anti-Germ Utility Key Tool with Retractable Badge Reel	Product size: 2-1/2"W x 3-3/8"H	Tool Color: Blue	300	75	375	No Bid	0
3	0	Lightweight tool, reinforced nylon hook, designed for							
		opening door handles of many sizes, up to 35 pounds. Rubberized tip (not a stylus) designed to use with various keypads. Includes carabiner and a 30"	First Connections logo in full color Imprint area: 13/16" Dia. (insert on badge reel)						
	+	retractable badge reel with metal pocket clip on back.							
	4			Badge Reel Color: Red					
5		Wood Handle Manual Open Golf Umbrella	Product size: 60° Arc / 40" Closed	Tool Color: Blue	300	75	375	No Bid	0
		Wood grip handle, aluminum frame, nylon material for panels.							
			First Connections logo in full color						
	1		Imprint area: 10"W x 6"H (Panel)	Red, White, Blue	400	100	500		
6		Double Wall Insulated Tumbler (Full Color Wrap)	Product size: 6"H	Red, White, blue	400	100		3.27	3270
	0	Clear lid with slide-lock opening to prevent spilling. Double wall insulated to keep drinks cold.	Capicity: 14 oz.						
	0	kep units tolo.	First Connections logo in full color as full color wrap insert around tumbler.						
			Imprint area:10"W x 5"H						
	Dav			1					
	The second s								
				Clear	850	150	1000		2000
7		Learn About ABCs & 123s Storybook Educational story book for children learning their letters and numbers. Book	Product size: 5-1/4"W x 5-1/4"H					0.44	2200
	3 30	includes 12 pages and a soft colorful cover. Printed on quiaity paper.	First Connections logo in full color . Imprint area: 4"W x 1-3/4"H (Bottom of Back Cover)						8
	100 March 100 Ma		Implificates, 4 W X 1-3/4 H (Buttom of Back Cover)						1
	I wrait out								
				Colorful cover	4000	1000	5000		
8		Animals on the Ferm Coloring & Activity Book	Product size: 8"W x 10-1/2"H					0.38	2850
	ANN MALE SHOT OF BALLIN	Book features a full color cover and 16 pages of coloring, puzzles, games, and more. Printed on quality paper.	First Connections logo						
	ANTERNALS on THE RAR.M	Recommended for children ages 3 and up.	Imprint area: 7"W x 1-3/4"H (Bottom of Front Cover)						
	The states								
	12 2								
	Vierene.				6000	1500	7500		

		for white the state of a state to the state to	and the attention of the second				1	0.38	2850
9	Ether Woodb	Fun with First Words Coloring & Activity Book Book featuress full color cover and 16-pages of coloring and engaging activities that help children learn and recognize common first words. Printed on quality paper.	Product size: 8"W x 10-1/2"H First Connections logo Imprint area: 7"W x 1-3/4"H (Bottorn of Front Cover)					0.38	2850
					6000	1500	7500		
10		Fun with Shapes Coloring & Activity Book Book features full color cover and 15-pages of coloring and engaging activities that help children learn and recognize shapes. Printed on quality paper.	Product size: 8"W x 10-1/2"H First Connections logo Imprint area: 7"W x 1-3/4"H (Bottom of Front Cover)					0.38	2850
					6000	1500	7500		
11		Pilot 62 Gel Pen Retractable gel pen features a contoured rubber grip. Ink color matches accent color. Rubbeitzed grip for writing comfort and control. Materiai: Plastic Ink Color: Red Ink Type: Gel Point Type: Fine Point Size: .7 mm	Product size: L 1.31 x W 2.88 x H 5.75 inches First Connections logo in full color Imprint area: 3/8" x 1-1/2" Imprint Location: Barrel	ink color: Red	833	167	1000	1.15	1150
12		Pilot G2 Gei Pen	Product size: L 1.31 x W 2.88 x H 5.75 inches	Ink color: Red	633	16/	1000	1.15	1150
		Retractable gel pen features a contoured rubber grip. Ink color matches accent color, Rubberlæd grip for writing comfort and control. Material: Plastic Ink Color: Blue Ink Type: Gel Point Type: Fine Point Stype: Tine	First Connections logo in full color Imprint area: 3/8" x 1-1/2* Imprint Location: Barrel	(nk color: Blue	834	166	1000		
13		Pilot G2 Gei Pen	Product size: L 1.31 x W 2.88 x H 5.75 inches	ink color: side	854	100	1000	1.15	1150
		Retractable gel pen features a contoured rubber grip. Ink color matches accent color. Rubber/zed grip for writing comfort and control. Material: Plastic Ink Color: Black Ink Type: Gel Point Type: Fine Point Size: .7 mm	First Connections logo in full color Imprint area: 3/8" x 3-1/2" Imprint Location: Barrel	(nk color; Black	833	167	1000		
14	Red Red	Flip & Lock Toddler Cup Polypropylere flip and lock cup with spout for sipping Shipped fully assembled. Material: Polypropylene BPA free.	Product capacity: 10 oz First Connections logo in full color as a wrap of the cup. Imprint area: 2°H x 2-1/2°W Each side (one side or both sides) 2°H x 6-1/4°W Wrap	Cup Color: White Lid Color: Biue	1000	250	1250	No Bid	0
15	Ø	Flip & Lock Toddler Cup	Product capacity: 10 oz	Lio Color: Brue	1000	250	1250	No Bid	0
	E Blue	Polypropylene filp and lock cup with spout for sloping Shippef fully assembled, Material: Polypropylene BPA free.	First Connections logo in full color as a wrap of the cup. Imprint area: 27H x 2-3/2 ^{27W} Each side (one side or both sides) 27H x 6-3/4 ² W Wrap	Cup Color: White Lid Color: Red	1000	250	1250		
16		Jannie Plush Beer with T-Shirt Made of polyester plush with plush fill, plastic eyes, thread sewn mouth and nose and T-shirts are 100% polyester. Bear is surface washable only. Toy safety tested to ASTM F963 specification.	Product size: 7*H First Connections logo Imprint area: 2 ^m W x 1 ^m H (Center of T-Shirt)					No Bid	0

17		Plueh Beer with T-Shirt Made of polyester plush with plush fill, plastic eyes, thread sewn mouth and nose and T-shirts are 100% polyester. Beer is surface washable only. Toy safety tested to ASTM F963 specification.	Product size: 7"H First Connections logo Imprint area: 2"W x 1"H (Center of T-Shirt)					No Bid	0
				Bear color: Light Brown T-Shirt color: Blue	200	50	250		
18	and the second	Plush Beer with T-Shirt	Product size: 7"H	1-Shirt color: blue	200	50	230	No Bid	0
		Made of polyester plush with plush fill, plastic eyes, thread sewn mouth and nose and T-shirts are 100% polyester. Bear is surface washable only. Toy safety tested to ASTM F963 specification.							
				Bear color: Light Brown T-Shirt color: White	200	50	250		
19		Antibacterial Moisturizing Gel Hend Sanitizer with Pump	Product size: 8 oz.	I-Shirt color: White	200	50	250	3.04	3866.88
	an.	Kills 99.9% of harmful germs and bacteria. Pump top makes for easy application. Moisturizing aloe helps keep hands from drying out. Contents: 75% Alcohol	First Connections logo in fuil color on a white label. Imprint area: Label size: 3.75" x 2"						
	11-25				1000	272	1272		
20	¢ (0.0	No-Contact Infrared Thermometer Features four modes; adult forehead mode, child forehead mode (12 & under), ear mode and object mode. Switch easily between Celsius and Fahrenheit. Can be used more than 3000 times, stores up to 40 sets of memory data. Includes operating manual, quick instruction sheet and drawstring storage bag. Two AAA batteries required, not included.	Product size: 5 3/8" \times 1 3/8" w First Connection logo in full color on the thermometer. Imprint size: 2"W \times 3/4"H					36.04	3604
21		Fun with Colors Coloring & Activity Book	Product size: 8"W x 10-1/2"H	Thermometer color: White	100	N/A	100	0.56	4200
21		run word corors corona, an accuracy score social Book features full color coroner and 15-pages of coloring and engaging activities that will help children learn and recognize colors.	First Connections logo Imprint area: 7"W x 1-3/4"H (Bottom of front cover)		6000	1500	7500	0.30	4200
22		Frosted Clear Shopper	Product size: 13"W x 6"D x 17"H		6000	1500	7500	0.77	1925
	Readon	3.5 mil hidensity frosted plastic bags with fused loop handles and a cardboard bottom insert. 100% recyclable.	First Connections logo Imprint area: S'W X S'H (one side of bag) Imprint Style: Metallic Foll						
			have a second second second second	Bag color: Frosted clear	2000	500	2500		
23	ß	Simplicity Singpack Features two zippered compariments to store accessories. Adjustable shoulder stags, pen loop and alde mesh pocket for water bottle. Material: 300 denier polycanvas.	Product size: 11-1/2"L x 16"H x 5"W First Connections logo in full color Imprint area: 4"W x 3-1/2"H (front of backpack)					No Bid	0
				Bag color: White	109	34	143		
24	6	Simplicity Singpack Features two lippered compartments to store accessories. Adjustable shoulder straps, pen loop and side mesh pocket for water bottle. Material: 300 denier polycanvas.	Product size: 11-1/2"L x 16"H x 5"W First Connections logo in white Imprint area: 4"W x 3-1/2"H (front of backpack)					No Bid	o
	6608			Bag color: Blue	108	33	141		

25		Simplicity Singpack Features two clippered compartments to store accessories. Adjustable shoulder straps, pen loop and side mesh pocket for water bottle. Material: 300 denier polycanvas.	Product size: 11-1/2*L x 16"H x 5"W First Connections logo in white					No Bid	0
	6		Imprint area: 4"W x 3-1/2"H (front of backpack)						
				Bag color: Red	108	33	141		
26		Jelly Beans Business Card Candy Case Clear plastic candy holder filled with jelly beans candles, packaged in clear plastic bag, has a lot for business card. Candy Colors: Assorted	Case Size: 3/4" W x 2" H x 4 1/2" L First Connections logo in full color Imprint Area: 3 1/2" W x 2" H					No 8id	0
				Case color: Clear Candy colors: Assorted	300	100	400		
27		M & M Business Cerd Candy Case	Case Size: 3/4" W x 2" H x 4 1/2" L					No Bid	0
	HERHOTME Gar	Clear plastic candy holder filled with M & M candles, packaged in clear plasti bag, has a slot for business card. Candy Colons: Assorted	First Connections logo in full color Imprint Area: 3 1/2° ₩ × 2° H						
				Case color: Clear Candy colors: Assorted	300	100	400		
28		Red Hot Business Card Candy Case Clear plastic candy holder filled with red hot candles, packaged in clear plastic bas, has a lot for business card. Candy Colors: Red	Case Size: 3/4" W x 2" H x 4 3/2" L First Connections logo in fuil color Imprint Area: 3 1/2" W x 2" H					No Bid	0
				Case color: Clear Candy colors: Red	150	50	200		
29		White Mints Business Card Candy Cese Clear plastic candy holder filled with white mints candles, packaged in clear plastic bag, has a slot for business card. Candy Colors: White	Case Size: 3/4" W x 2" H x 4 1/2" L First Connections logo in full color Imprint Area: 3 1/2" W x 2" H	Case color: Clear				No Bid	0
_		Skittles Business Card Candy Case	Case Size: 3/4" W x 2" H x 4 1/2" L	Candy colors: White	150	50	200	No Bid	0
90	EEX	Sections assumess Card Candy Case Clear plastic cardy holder filled with Skittles candles, packaged in clear plastic bag, has a slot for business card. Candy Colors: Assorted	Case Size: 5/4 W X 2 H X 4 J/2 C First Connections logo in full color Imprint Area: 3 1/2" W X 2" H						
				Case color: Clear Candy colors: Assorted	300	100	400		
31	100 Marine 1	Building Blocks Stress Reliever Squeezable foam blocks Material: Polyurethane Foam	Product size: 3-1/6" x 1-1/2" x 1-1/8" First Connections logo Imprint area: 2-1/2" x 1/2" Either side		150	37	187	No Bid	0
52	\$	Building Blocks Strass Reliever Squeezable foam blocks Material: Polyurethane Foam	Product size: 3-1/8" x 1-1/2" x 1-1/8" First Connections logo Imprint area: 2-1/2" x 1/2" Either side	Red	130		187	No Bid	0
				Blue	150	37	187		
33	1	Building Blocks Stress Reliever Squeezable foam blocks Material: Polyurethane Foam	Product size: 3-1/8" x 1-1/2" x 1-1/8" First Connections logo Imprint area: 2-3/2" x 1/2" Either side					No Bid	0
34		Building Blocks Stress Reliever	Product size: 3-1/8" x 1-1/2" x 1-1/8"	Yellow	150	38	188	No Bid	0
-1	1	Squeezable foam blocks Material: Polyurethane Foam	First Connections logo Imprint area: 2-1/2" x 1/2" Either side						
				Green	150	38	188		

			1- · · · ·					Na Rid	
35	•	Foan Basketball Squeezable foam basketball Material: Polyurethane Foam	Product size: 4" dia. First Connections logo Imprint area: 3-1/2"L x 3-1/2"W					No Bid	0
	9			Orange	600	150	750		
36		Foam Football Squeezable foam football Material: Polyurethane Foam	Product size: 4" x 2-1/2" First Connections logo Imprint area: 1-1/4"L x 1-1/4"W					1.68	1176
				Blue & White	600	150	700		
37	*	Reusable Weshable Double Layer Cotton Poly Face Mesk Non-medical. Intended for everyday use. 65% polyester 35% cotton. Ear loops : Rib TC 4-way stretch.	Product size: One Size First Connections logo in full color Imprint area: 2" x 1-1/2"					No Bid	0
				White	1250	250	1500		
38	-	Reusable Washable Double Layer Cotton Poly Face Mask Non-medical. Intended for everyday use. 65% polyester 35% cotton. Ear loops : Rib TC 4-way stretch.	Product size: One Size First Connections logo in full color Imprint area: 2" x 1-1/2"			500		No Bid	o
			the second	Gray	1250	250	1500	No Bid	0
39	A	Super Soft Lap Shoulder Onesia (hort riseves) Material: So a 100% combed inspon coton in a 1x1 baby r/b Sewn with 100% cotton thread. Features flatlock seams, reinforced three- snap closure on binding, and double-needle ribbed binding on neck, shoulders, sleeves and leg openings. CPSIA Compliant - tracking label in side seam.	Size: 6 month First Connections logo in full color Imprint area: Front: 3°w x 3°h			150	760	NG BIQ	0
40		Super Soft Lap Shoulder Onesie (short sleeves)	Size: 12 month	White	600	150	750	No Bid	0
	3)	Material: 5.0 oz 100% combed ringspun cotton in a 1x1 baby rib Sewn with 100% cotton thread. Features flatlock seams, reinforced three- snap closure on binding, and cloble-need en binding on neck, shoulders, sleeves and leg openings. CPSA Compliant - tracking label in side seam.	First Connections logo in full color Imprint area: Front: 3°w x 3°h						
		Catton Jersey Taddler T-Shirt (short sleeves)	Size: 2T	White	600	150	750	No Bid	0
41		Cotton Array Todder 1-Shirt (nort seves) Material: Sz. 200% cotton (erwy Festures ribbed crew neck, shoulder-to-shoulder taping, and double-needle stitched sleeves and bottom hem. CPGIA Compliant - tracking label in side seam.	Size: 2T First Connections logo in fuli color Imprint area: Front: 3"w x 3"h					in the	v
				White	600	150	750	No Bid	
42		Cotton kersey Toddler T-Shirt (short keeves) Material: 5.5 oz. 100% cotton jersey Features: fibed crew neck, shoulder-to-shoulder taping, and double-needle stitched sleeves and bottom hem. CPSIA Compliant - tracking label in side seam.	Size: 4T First Connections logo in full color Imprint area: Front: 3"w x 3"h					NO BIO	0
				White	600	150	750		
43	Restration	Standard Crayons - 4 Pack Safe and certified non-toxic.	Product size: 3-3/4"W x 1-1/2"H First Connections logo Imprint area: 2"W x 3/4"H (back of box)					0.41	4100
	dar ter all ter an dar ter			Crayon colors: Blue, Green, Red, Yellow	7500	2500	10,000		

	Toddler Feeding Set	First Connections logo in full color					3.9	3900
Read Fil	Set contains: bowl with snap-on lid, a 6 ounce juice cup and a fork and	1"H x 3"W Bowl, per side				1		1
1. 35 -	spoon.	2"H x 1-7/8"W Cup, per side						1
ALC: NO	Material: Polypropylene BPA free	1/2"H x 2"W Fork & Spoon	-					1
A MARKED								1
				1				1
			1	1				1
1								í.
								1
			2.00.25mil	750	250	1000		6

AUTHORIZATION SIGNATURE By my signature below, I certify that the aforementioned statements are true and correct and that I accept the Terms and Conditions as presented in this bid, and that I am authorized by the respondent to submit this bid on his/her behalf.

3/26/2021 Director Vender Name: Blink Marketing Inc dba Blinkswag Date: Signatu Title Darland Zwollinski Printed

Agency request fifty percent (50%) of each version (English & Spanish) promotional items ordered shipped within thirty (30) days after receipt of order. The remaining items are to be shipped over the next thirty (30) days. The Contractor must ensure all items are delivered on time, regardless of order size.

If this delivery schedule cannot be met, bidder must state number of days required to place commodity in ordering agency's designated location. Failure to state delivery time obligates bidder to complete delivery by agency's requested date. Extended delivery dates may be considered when in the best interest of the state.

Delivery_ days after receipt of order.