

Bid Sheet for Solicitation 710-21-0032 Promotional Items

Read By: Jeff Pardikes Recorded by: Brandi Bensen Bid Opening : 3/29/2021 at 2:00 p.m.

		Bidder 1 Name	Bidder 2 Name	Bidder 3 Name	Bidder 4 Name	Bidder 5 Name
Item Number	Description	Safeguard Business Systems DISA B+B Solutions	Magna IV	Blink Marketing Inc	J+R Marketing Inc	
1	Antibacterial Sanitizer Unscented BZK Wet Wipes	\$ 3,075.00	\$ 2,925.00	\$ 4,650.00	\$ 3,000.00	
2	Reusable Forehead Thermometer in Sleeve	\$ 8,460.00	\$ 4,620.00	\$ 4,110.00	\$ 4,020.00	
3	Touchless Anti-Germ Utility Key Tool with Retractable Badge Reel	\$ 2,452.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
4	Touchless Anti-Germ Utility Key Tool with Retractable Badge Reel	\$ 2,452.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
5	Wood Handle Manual Open Golf Umbrella	\$ 4,835.00	\$ 6,515.00	NO BID	NO BID	
6	Double Wall Insulated Tumbler (Full Color Wrap)	\$ 3,781.00	\$ 6,543.40	\$ 3,270.00	\$ 4,190.00	
7	Learn About ABCs & 123s Storybook	\$ 4,569.00	\$ 5,068.00 \$ 5,068.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 2,700.00	
8	Animals on the Farm Coloring & Activity Book	\$ 3,385.50	\$ 5,034.00	\$ 2,850.00	\$ 4,050.00	
9	Fun with First Words Coloring & Activity Book	\$ 3,385.50	\$ 5,034.00	\$ 2,850.00	\$ 4,050.00	
10	Fun with Shapes Coloring & Activity Book	\$ 3,385.50	\$ 5,034.00	\$ 2,850.00	\$ 4,050.00	
11	Pilot G2 Gel Pen	\$ 1,860.00	\$ 2,050.20	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 540.00	
12	Pilot G2 Gel Pen	\$ 1,860.00	\$ 2,049.70	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 540.00	
13	Pilot G2 Gel Pen	\$ 1,860.00	\$ 2,050.20	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 540.00	
14	Flip & Lock Toddler Cup	\$ 2,575.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
15	Flip & Lock Toddler Cup	\$ 2,575.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
16	Jannie Plush Bear with T-Shirt	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 1,594.00	NO BID	\$ 1,197.50	
17	Jannie Plush Bear with T-Shirt	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 1,594.00	NO BID	\$ 1,197.50	
18	Jannie Plush Bear with T-Shirt	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 1,594.00	NO BID	\$ 1,197.50	
19	Antibacterial Moisturizing Gel Hand Sanitizer with Pump	\$ 58,275.76	\$ 4,067.98	\$ 3,866.88	\$ 3,803.28	
20	No-Contact Infrared Thermometer	\$ 3,935.00	\$ 3,940.00	\$ 3,604.00	NO BID	
21	Fun with Colors Coloring & Activity Book	\$ 3,375.00	\$ 5,090.25	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 4,050.00	
22	Frosted Clear Shopper	\$ 2,194.50	\$ 2,887.00	\$ 1,925.00	\$ 1,460.00	
23	Simplicity Slingpack	\$ 1,128.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 938.08	
24	Simplicity Slingpack	\$ 1,128.00	\$ 1,600.10	NO BID	\$ 924.96	
25	Simplicity Slingpack	\$ 1,128.00	\$ 1,600.10	NO BID	\$ 924.96	
26	Jelly Beans Business Card Candy Case	\$ 1,048.00	\$ 1,047.24	NO BID	\$ 796.00	
27	M & M Business Card Candy Case	\$ 1,140.00	\$ 1,152.20	NO BID	\$ 796.00	
28	Red Hot Business Card Candy Case	\$ 692.00	\$ 794.88	NO BID	\$ 398.00	
29	White Mints Business Card Candy Case	\$ 678.00	\$ 794.88	NO BID	\$ 398.00	
30	Skittles Business Card Candy Case	\$ 1,088.00	\$ 1,070.00	NO BID	\$ 796.00	
31	Building Blocks Stress Reliever	\$ 254.32	\$ 58.40	NO BID	\$ 233.75	
32	Building Blocks Stress Reliever	\$ 254.32	\$ 58.40	NO BID	\$ 233.75	
33	Building Blocks Stress Reliever	\$ 255.68	\$ 58.39	NO BID	\$ 235.00	
34	Building Blocks Stress Reliever	\$ 255.68	\$ 58.39	NO BID	\$ 235.00	
35	Foam Basketball	\$ 1,717.50	\$ 2,391.00	\$ 1,176.00	\$ 1,417.50	
36	Foam Football	\$ 896.00	\$ 1,365.97	NO BID	\$ 1,078.00	
37	Reusable Washable Double Layer Cotton Poly Face Mask	\$ 4,455.00	\$ 8,608.95	NO BID	NO BID	
38	Reusable Washable Double Layer Cotton Poly Face Mask	\$ 4,455.00	\$ 8,608.95	NO BID	NO BID	
39	Super Soft Lap Shoulder Onesie (short sleeves)	\$ 3,562.50	\$ 5,921.00	NO BID	\$ 3,187.50	
40	Super Soft Lap Shoulder Onesie (short sleeves)	\$ 3,562.50	\$ 5,921.00	NO BID	\$ 3,187.50	
41	Cotton Jersey Toddler T-Shirt (short sleeves)	\$ 3,112.50	\$ 4,185.00	NO BID	\$ 2,700.00	
42	Cotton Jersey Toddler T-Shirt (short sleeves)	\$ 3,112.50	\$ 4,185.00	NO BID	\$ 2,700.00	
43	Standard Crayons - 4 Pack	\$ 4,060.00	\$ 2,964.00	\$ 4,100.00	\$ 3,000.00	
44	Toddler Feeding Set	\$ 7,310.00	NO BID	\$ 3,900.00	\$ 5,990.00	